
















































the undertaking of the whole or any part of the property of the 

Company (both present and future) including its uncalled capital for 

the time being. 

 

127.  Subject to the provisions of the Act any debenture, bonds or other 

securities may be issued by the Company at discount, premium or 

otherwise, with any special privileges as to redemption, surrender, 

drawings, allotment of shares, appointment of the Directors or 

otherwise Debentures and bonds with right to allotment of or 

Conversion into shares shall not be issued except with the sanction of 

the Company in General meeting and Compliance of the provisions of 

the Act.” 

 





THE COMPANIES ACT, 2013 

(PRIVATE COMPANY LIMITED BY SHARES) 

MEMORANDUM OF ASSOCIATION 

OF 

eXp GLOBAL INDIA PRIVTE LIMITED  

I. The name of the Company is “eXp GLOBAL INDIA PRIVATE LIMITED”  

 

II. The registered office of the Company will be situated in the State of 

Delhi. 

 

III. (a) The objects to be pursued by the Company on its incorporation 

are: 

1. To carry on the business of owning and operating a cloud-based real 

estate brokerage business, development and use of cloud-based 

technologies, development of proprietary cloud-based transactional 

platform to provide real estate brokerage services, property listings, and 

sellers list properties, provide buyers and sellers access to a network of 

professional, agents and brokers.  

 

2. To carry on the business of providing marketing, training and other 

support services to brokers and agents through use of proprietary 

technology enabled services, 3D virtual reality platform, as well as 

technology and support services contracted to third parties.  

 

(b)  Matters which are necessary for furtherance of the objects 

      specified in Clause III (a) above are: 

1. To procure the registration, incorporation, or recognition of the Company 

under the laws or regulations of India and that of any other country and 

to do all acts necessary for carrying on business or activity of the Company 

as per main objects as aforesaid. 

 

2. To acquire from any person, firm, body corporate or Government whether 

in India and/or outside India in the public or private sector technical 

information, technical know-how, management and managerial know-

how, process engineering, technical engineering and financial engineering 

related knowledge, required for any business of the Company and to 

acquire any grant or license and other rights and benefits in the foregoing 

matters and things. 

 

3. To apply for charter, privilege, concession, license or authorization of any 

Government, state, or municipality, provisional order or license from any 

authority for enabling the Company to carry out any of its objects into 

effect or for extending any of the powers of the Company or for effecting 

any modification of the Company or for any other purpose which may 

seem expedient and to oppose any proceeding or application which may 



seem calculated directly, or indirectly to prejudice the interest of the 

Company. 

 

4. To buy /acquire/lease/rent all kind of plant, equipment. machinery, 
apparatus, material (raw, finished, or semi-finished), land, building and 
any movable or immovable property, technical knowhow, expertise, 
manpower, for production and manufacturing in India or abroad any 
products or services as per the main object of the Company.  

 
5. To apply for, purchase or otherwise acquire any patents, patent rights, 

copyrights, trademarks, formulae, licenses, lease, concessions and the 
like or any secret or other information, the acquisition of which may seem 
calculated directly or indirectly to benefit the Company in any jurisdiction, 
and to use, exercise, develop or grant licenses in respect of the property, 
rights or information so acquired. 

 
6. To carry on business of promotion, distribution, marketing, organizing 

events, seminars, conferences, printing of brochures, magazine any other 
sales aid, advertising etc. for sale of all products or in any way for 
accomplishment of main objective.  

 
7. To open and operate any type of bank accounts, including overdraft 

accounts with any bank and obtain credit facilities with or without 
securities for its business.  

 
8. To borrow money, overdraw from accounts with banks, juristic persons or 

other financial institutions, with or without security; as well as to accept, 
issue, transfer, discount, execute or endorse bills of exchange, promissory 
notes, bills of lading or other negotiable instruments, except for the 
banking business, finance business and credit finance business. 

 
9. To advance money or give credit to any person or Company; to give 

guarantee or indemnify for the payment of money or the performance of 
contracts or obligations by any person; to secure or undertake in any way 
the repayment of money lent or advanced to, or the liabilities incurred by 
any person subject to the provisions of the act.  

 
10. To buy, procure, receive, take on lease, take on sublease, buy on hire 

purchase, lease out, sublease out, sell with right of redemption, repair, 
own, possess, improve, use or otherwise manage any property whatsoever, 
land, buildings, constructions, indoor and outdoor premises of buildings 
and parking areas, common property of the condominium, as well as the 
fruits thereof.  

 
11. To establish branch offices or to appoint agents, domestically or overseas. 

 

12. To apply for and become member of any Company, association, body 
Corporate or society having any objects similar or identical to those of the 
company or likely to directly or indirectly promote the interest of thee 
company. 

 
13. To purchase, build, carry out, equip, maintain, alter, improve, develop, 

manage, work, control and superintend any plants, warehouse, sheds, 
offices, shops, stores, buildings, machinery, apparatus, labor lines and 
houses, warehouses and such other works and conveniences necessary 
for carrying on the main business of the Company. 



 
14. To undertake or promote scientific research relating to the main business 

or class of the business of the Company. 
 
15. To take over the whole or any part of the business, goodwill, trademarks 

properties and liabilities of any person or persons, firm, companies or 
undertakings either existing or new, engaged in or carrying on or 
proposing to carry on business this Company is authorized to carry on, 
possession of any property or rights suitable for the purpose of the 
Company and to pay for the same either in cash or in shares or partly in 
cash and partly in shares or otherwise.  
 

16. To carry on a business of collecting, compiling, preparing, publishing and 
distributing all types of statistics, data and information, and analysis 
thereof for attainment of its objective including but not limited to data 
mining, data management, refinement of data, call center operations for 
attainment of its objective. 
 

17. To dispose of, to improve, manage, develop or exchange the undertaking, 
property or rights of the Company or any part thereof.  

 
18. To create any depreciation fund, reserve, reserve fund, sinking fund, 

insurance fund or any special or other fund whether for repayment of 
redeemable preference shares, redemption of debenture stock, for 
dividends, for equalizing dividends, for repairing, improving, extending 
and maintaining any part of the property of the Company.  

 
19. To establish and maintain or procure the establishment and maintenance 

of any contributory or non-contributory pension or superannuation funds, 
or Trusts for the benefit of, and give or procure the giving of donations, 
gratuities, pensions, allowances or emoluments or stock options to any 
persons who are or were at any time in the employment or service of the 
Company, or, of any Company which is a subsidiary of the Company or is 
allied to or associated with the Company or with any such subsidiary 
Company, or who are or were at any time directors or officers of the 
Company or of any such other Company as aforesaid, and the wives, 
widows, families and dependents of any such persons, and also establish 
and subsidize and subscribe to any institutions, associations, clubs or 
funds calculated to be for the benefit of or to or towards the insurance of 
any such persons as aforesaid and do any of the matters aforesaid, either 
alone or in conjunction with any such other Company as aforesaid. 
 

20. To subscribe for, absolutely or conditionally or otherwise acquire, hold, 
dispose of shares and securities or obligations of any other Company 
whether Indian or foreign.  

 
21. To invest the surplus fund of the company in any security, deposit, units 

of Mutual funds, Government bonds or any other securities permitted by 
law and to dispose and deal with them in all manner.  

 
22. To establish subsidiary companies, amalgamate with or enter into 

partnership, joint ventures, or into any arrangement for sharing profits, 
union of interest, joint venture,  reciprocal concession or co-operation 
with, any person or Company carrying on, engaged in, or proposing to 
carry on or engage in, any business or transaction which the Company is 
authorized to carry on or engage in, or which is capable of being conducted 
so as directly or indirectly to benefit the Company; to take or otherwise 



acquire or hold shares, stock, securities, obligations or other interests in 
any such person or Company, and to subsidize or otherwise assist any 
person or Company.  

 
23. To acquire and undertake the whole or any part of the business, property 

and liabilities of any person carrying on the business which the Company 
is authorized to carry on or possession of property suitable for the purpose 
of the objects of the Company.  

 
24. To issue or allot fully or partly paid shares in the capital of the Company 

in payment or part payment of any movable or immovable property 
purchased or otherwise acquired by the Company or any services rendered 
to the Company.  

 
25. To pay out of the funds of the Company all or any expenses which the 

Company may lawfully pay for services rendered for formation and 
registration of the Company and for promotion of any other Company by 
it subject to the Act.  

 
26. To insure any of the properties, undertakings, contracts, risk or 

obligations of the Company in any manner whatsoever.  
 
27. To train or pay for training in India or Abroad of any of Company’s 

employees or officers or any candidate in the interest of or in furtherance 
of the Company’s objects. To establish training facilities for providing 
training to the Company’s employees, distributor customer, franchises 
and other people.   

 
28. To adopt such means of making known and advertising the business and 

products of the Company as may be expedient.  
 
29. To aid and support, any person, association, body or movement, whose 

object is solution, settlement or surmounting of industrial or labor 
problems or of the promotion of science and technology, cultural activities, 
sports, protection of environment, rural development and other social, 
welfare and recreational activities.  

 
30. To purchase, build, take on lease or tenancy or in exchange, hire, take 

options over or otherwise acquire any estates, lands, buildings, or other 
interests, right in immovable properties and to hold concessions, licenses, 
privileges, claims leases or option which may appear to be necessary or 
convenient for any business of the company and to sell, lease, mortgage, 
hypothecate or otherwise dispose of or grant rights over any immovable 
property belonging to the company.  
 

31. To carry on the business of marketing information of all kinds and to carry 
on the business of market research and marketing of goods, articles and 
services, web designing, e-platform, networking and other related thereto. 

 
32. To form, constitute and promote or join in promoting companies, 

association, and undertakings of all kinds.  
 
33. The Company may anytime invite and receive or without any such 

invitation receive gifts of immovable or movable property and offerings or 
voluntary donations of bequests and legacies, either from shareholders, 
or from any other persons, for the attainment of all or any of the objects 
of the Company, with or without any special conditions.  



 
34. To arrange the Company to be registered, incorporated or recognized in 

any place outside India. 
 

IV     The Liability of the member(s) is limited, and this Liability is limited to  the 

amount unpaid, if any, on the shares held by them. 

V     The Authorized Share Capital of the Company is Rs. 1,00,000 (Rupees 

One Lakh Only) divided into 10,000 (Ten Thousand) Equity Shares of 

Rs. 10/- (Rupees Ten) each. 
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