Re: Reminder... Refund delay ..... (RESPONSE FROM ASHVINDER BHAR])
Ashvinder Bharj <ash.bharj@shristicorp.com>
Sun 12/1/2019 10:04 PM

You;

Aditya Rohatgi;

shobhit.gupta@shristicorp.com;

Aditi

Perfect

Sent from my iPhone
On 2 Dec 2019, at 11:19, Aditya Rohatgi <aditya.rohatgi@shristicorp.com> wrote:

Dear Mr. Biswas,

As discussed this morning, our meeting tomorrow at 12PM at the Westin is confirmed.
Look forward to seeing you tomorrow.

Best Regards

Aditya

:A_ditya Rohatgi
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