From: Sanjay Kumar Patodia sanjaykumarpatodia@gmail.com
Subject: Fwd: Ideal Aqua View, Block B, Barbet, Unit No: Ground B
Date: March 4, 2020 at 2:02 PM
To: SANJAY KUMAR PATODIA sanjaykumarpatodia@gmail.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Anuj Tulsyan <atulsyan@ideal.in>

Date: Wed, Mar 21, 2018 at 2:13 PM

Subject: RE: Ideal Aqua View, Block B, Barbet, Unit No: Ground B

To: Sweta Patodia <swetapatodia87 @gmail.com>

Cc: <sanjaykumarpatodia@gmail.com>, Shagun Sureka <shagun.sureka@ideal.in>, <sourav.das@ideal.in>

Dear Mr Patodia

Pl note that the po ion for fit outs of your flat will be given in
December 2018.

You are requested to please release the due payments asap.

Regards

Anuj Tulsyan

From: Sweta Patodia [mailto:swetapatodia87 @gmail.com]

Sent: 20 March 2018 17:43

To: atulsyan@ideal.in

Cc: sanjaykumarpatodia@gmail.com; Shagun Sureka; sourav.das@ideal.in
Subject: Ideal Aqua View, Block B, Barbet, Unit No: Ground B

Dear Mr. Tulsyan

We, Sanjay Patodia and Sweta Patodia, were allotted the above flat for a
total consideration of INR 8,790,526/- vide allotment letter dated 16th
April 2014. Total amount paid by us so far stands at INR 4,100,000.

The balance amount of INR 4,690,526 is lying ready with us.

Please let us know when will the flat be ready for possession.

Thanks & Regards

Sanjay Patodia
Sweta Patodia



