6/16/2020 Yahoo Mail - Final payment as per demand letter of Flat C7/903

Final payment as per demand letter of Flat C7/903

From: de.chandan@yahoo.co.in (de.chandan@yahoo.co.in)
To: krishnakant.soni@emamirealty.com

Date: Wednesday, 31 July, 2019, 10:04 pm IST

Dear Mr. Sony
As per the soft copy of demand letter after deducting TDS credit Rs.1594591/- was transferred to Emami
Realty Limited by NEFT today. NEFT advice is attached.

Let me know when I will come for handover of the flat.

Regards
Chandan De

On Saturday, 13 July, 2019, 07:31:43 pm IST, Krishnakant Soni <krishnakant.soni@emamirealty.com> wrote:

Attached copy of demand letter.

On Sat, Jul 13, 2019 at 4:25 PM de.chandan@yahoo.co.in <de.chandan@yahoo.co.in> wrote:

----- Forwarded message -----

From: de.chandan@yahoo.co.in <de.chandan@yahoo.co.in>
To: ARITAKUMAR <arita.kumar@emamirealty.com>

Cc: dipa.das@emamirealty.com <dipa.das@emamirealty.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 July, 2019, 11:45:30 am IST

Subject: TDS deposit receipt of flat C7/903

| have deposited TDS 5 times after 1st April 2016 and every time it was send to you. At present | recovered soft
copy of 4 TDS. TDS credit is not reflected in final demand notice.
Please send me soft copy of corrected demand notice.

Thanks
Chandan De

Regards,

Krishna Kant Soni

Manager - CRM

Emami Realty Limited,

2, Jessore Road. Kolkata —700028
Phone:- +91 33 3000 6000 / 6292190271
Website: www.emamirealty.com
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