Booking Cancelletion » DO -

Soma Ray <somaray1974@gmail.com> Jun 18,2019, 5:01 PM * -«
to customercare v

Date: 17.06.2019

To

The Developer
Bally Imperia
BG Group

Dear Sir,

1 would like to inform you the we have booked a Shop in your property. My booking ID is
B1192-00016-SR . We have already paid an amount of Rs.284592.00. Recently Iwe have some
problem in our business . So | want to cancel this booking.

Please do the needful as early as possible and refund my amount as per your guideline.
Thanking you.

Regards

Soma Roy and Samarjit Roy Roy

» - To CcBec B

-------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Soma Ray <somaray1974@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 18 Jun 2019, 17:01

Subject: Booking Cancelletion

To: <customercare@pioneerproperty.in>

Date: 17.06.2019

To

The Developer
Bally Imperia
BG Group

Dear Sir,

I would like to inform you the we have booked a Shop in your property. My booking ID is
B1192-00016-SR . We have already paid an amount of Rs.284592.00. Recently Iwe have some
problem in our business . So | want to cancel this booking.

Please do the needful as early as possible and refund my amount as per your guideline.
Thanking you.

Regards
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