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Om Prakash Sharma <sales@jaivinayakgroup.com> Sat, Jun 27, 2020 at 1:30 PM
To: RAJESH KUMAR <rksbmaar@gmail.com>
Cc: Legal <legal@jaivinayakgroup.com>, Suman D <suman.d@pioneerproperty.in>, Basant R
<basant.r@pioneerproperty.in>, Customer Care - <customercare@pioneerproperty.in>

Dear  Sir, 
 
Your flat cancellation request is under process. Since you have availed bank loan consent from the said bank is
required to cancel your flat. therefore please 1st provide us the consent from the bank.. 

Thanks and Regards,
 

 

Om Prakash Sharma

Post Sales
P: (033) 46019040  M: +919800635695
A:  PS Srijan Corporate Park, Block-GP, Sector V, Saltlake,

Tower II, Room 202, Kolkata-700091
w: www.jaivinayakgroup.com  e: sales@jaivinayakgroup.com

    

On 2020-04-08 6:04 pm, RAJESH KUMAR wrote:
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