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Fwd: Cancellation and Refund

Abhijit Saha <asaha270@gmail.com> Wed, Jul 29, 2020 at 12:07 PM
To: abhijit.saha@pwc.com

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Abhijit Saha <asaha270@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, Mar 21, 2020 at 12:26 PM
Subject: Cancellation and Refund

To: <atulsyan@ideal.in>

Cc: <nakul@ideal.in>

Dear Mr Anuj,

| have booked an apartment in Ideal Aquaview ( Flat 3B, Block Barbet ) back in 2014 and you could not provide position
till 31st December , 2018 - even one year after the scheduled handover date. Under that circumstances, i had exercised
my right of cancellation on 15th March, 2019 and request you to cancel my booking and refund the amount with interest

from the date of payment of each installment . Till now i have not received any response on the same request . Request

you to reply and take prompt action on the same.

Attached is the proof of evidence of Cancellation Request.

Abhijit Saha
Abhijit Saha

ﬂ cancellation_request.pdf
855K
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