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M Gmail ASHWINI KUMAR <ashwini83kumar@gmail.com>

Re: Cancellation of Booked FLAT (Flat No. 3 'C’, 3rd Floor, in Block-5, Part- B in a under
construction housing society namely Vinayak Golden Acres, Konnagar)

ASHWINI KUMAR <ashwini83kumar@gmail.com> Thu, Dec 10, 2020 at 12:37 AM
To: sales@)jaivinayakgroup.com, legal@jaivinayakgroup.com, Pioneer Customer Care <customercare@pioneerproperty.in>
Cc: sbi.00178@sbi.co.in, sbi.10263@sbi.co.in, shrikant.pandey@sbi.co.in

Reminder 19
Sir/Madam,
All necessary documents desired by you have been provided regarding cancellation of the said flat. You are requested to refund the
total amount disbursed by both (bank & me) alongwith accrued interest to the bank. The whole refundable amount should be
deposited/credited as per information provide by the AGM, SBI RACPC Howrah Maidan (Or paid through bank cheque/draft) alongwith
12% interest (according to reverse interest calculation) as soon as possible.

With regards

Preeti kumari

Ashwini kumar

AF 458, CPWD CAMPUS
SALT LAKE

KOLKATA-700064
MOB-7004286350/9534675132

On Tue, 8 Dec, 2020, 11:45 PM ASHWINI KUMAR, <ashwini83kumar@gmail.com> wrote:
Reminder 18
Sir/Madam,
All necessary documents desired by you have been provided regarding cancellation of the said flat. You are requested to refund the
total amount disbursed by both (bank & me) alongwith accrued interest to the bank. The whole refundable amount should be
deposited/credited as per information provide by the AGM, SBI RACPC Howrah Maidan (Or paid through bank cheque/draft)
alongwith 12% interest (according to reverse interest calculation) as soon as possible.

With regards

Preeti kumari

Ashwini kumar

AF 458, CPWD CAMPUS
SALT LAKE

KOLKATA-700064
MOB-7004286350/9534675132

On Sun, 6 Dec, 2020, 5:39 PM ASHWINI KUMAR, <ashwini83kumar@gmail.com> wrote:
Reminder 17
Sir/Madam,
All necessary documents desired by you have been provided regarding cancellation of the said flat. You are requested to refund
the total amount disbursed by both (bank & me) alongwith accrued interest to the bank. The whole refundable amount should be
deposited/credited as per information provide by the AGM, SBI RACPC Howrah Maidan (Or paid through bank cheque/draft)
alongwith 12% interest (according to reverse interest calculation) as soon as possible.

With regards

Preeti kumari

Ashwini kumar

AF 458, CPWD CAMPUS
SALT LAKE

KOLKATA-700064
MOB-7004286350/9534675132

Show quoted text

On Fri, 4 Dec, 2020, 5:26 PM ASHWINI KUMAR, <ashwini83kumar@gmail.com> wrote:
Reminder 16
Sir,
All necessary documents desired by you have been provided regarding cancellation of the said flat. You are requested to refund
the total amount disbursed by both (bank & me) alongwith accrued interest to the bank. The whole refundable amount should be
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