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Mayukh Sarkar

From: Mayukh Sarkar <mayukhsarkar@yahoo.co.in>
Sent: 05 December 2019 16:21
To: Mayukh Sarkar
Subject: Fw: Flat -8G Affinia Unimark Riviera

“External email. Open with Caution” 

 

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android 
 

----- Forwarded message ----- 
From: "Mayukh Sarkar" <mayukhsarkar@yahoo.co.in> 
To: "sahin@unimarkgroup.com" <sahin@unimarkgroup.com> 
Sent: Sat, 20 Apr 2019 at 15:13 
Subject: Re: Flat -8G Affinia Unimark Riviera 
Dear Sahin,  
 
Thanks for reply and the drawing. I requested for the date of CC only. Not copy of the document. I need to 
mention the date in investment declaration. Otherwise won't get the tax exemption on the interest being 
paid. 
 
Regards 
Mayukh 

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android 
 
On Sat, 20 Apr 2019 at 13:26, Sahin Hossain 
<sahin@unimarkgroup.com> wrote: 

Dear Mr. Sarkar,  
 
It is a partial group document, presently we cant share it. It will be shared to the society after possession. 
 
 

Right-click 
here to  
download 
pictures.  To  
help protect 
your privacy, 
Outlo ok 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet. 

 
 
On Fri, Apr 19, 2019 at 1:50 PM Mayukh Sarkar <mayukhsarkar@yahoo.co.in> wrote: 
Dear Sahin, 
 
As expressed over phone, I need the date of Completion Certificate (CC) from Uttarpara Municipallty for Phase-1 of 
the project. Or a copy of the same certificate which ever is convenient. because i will get tax exemption on the 
interest part being paid to the bank if the property has received CC. The date is required for income tax and 
investment declaration in my organisation by this month. 
 
Shall be grateful if you arrange the same at the earliest. 
 
Thank you 
 
With regards 
Mayukh Sarkar 
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On Saturday, 13 April, 2019, 1:55:05 pm IST, Mayukh Sarkar <mayukhsarkar@yahoo.co.in> wrote:  
 
 
Dear Sahin,  
 
As requested you today at Riviera Sales office, kindly arrange to send an AutoCAD drawing of the 8G unit in Affinia 
with Furniture and Electrical points layout.  
 
As explained it is required for Interior design purpose. 
 
Thank you. With regards 
 
Mayukh Sarkar 
Mob: 9432425996 

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android 


