Basak, Asit Kumar

From: asitbasak20@yahoo.co.in

Sent: Monday, November 22, 2021 12:33 AM

To: Basak, Asit Kumar

Subject: Fw: Registration of my apartment - Tower 35, Flat 13A3

CAUTION: External email. Please do not click on links/attachments unless you know the content is genuine and safe.

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

—- Forwarded message —-

From: "asitbasak20@yahoo.co.in" <asitbasak20@yahoo.co.in>

To: "Customer Care" <customercare@hilandcal.com>

Cc: "Jayanta Ghosh™ <jayanta@hilandcal.com>, "crscare@hilandcal.com” <crscare@hilandcal.com>
Sent: Thu, 11 Feb 2021 at 19:21

Subject: RE: Registration of my apartment - Tower 35, Flat 13A3

Dear Sir,

| hope you have re-started Registration of flats as per your previous mail as below.

Please note that | have paid registration fees, stamp duty and legal fees back on 27th April 2017. So, it is pending for 4
years and | expect my registration in the first few days.

So, please let me know my registration date. | have a plan to be outstationed soon for official work and hence in hurry.
Hope you will understand my case and treat the matter urgently.

Regards,

Asit Kumar Basak
Tower 35, Flat 13A3

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Mon, 11 Jan 2021 at 18:13, Customer Care
<customercare@hilandcal.com> wrote:

Dear Mr. Basak,
Greetings from Hiland Group!

This is with reference to your below given mail regarding your apartment 13A3 Tower 35 at Hiland Greens. Regarding
registration, we would like to inform you that you will be notified from our office as and when registration of your
apartment will be scheduled. We are expecting to resume registrations in smaller lots from next month onwards basis
the sequence of payment for stamp duty and registration received from customers. Considering the date of your
payment, you will be notified about the registration of your apartment in the next 7-8 month’s time.



Thanks

Regards
HILAND

Sales & Marketing Office

Anandiok Building, 227 A.J).C Boze Road, Block-B 4" Floor, Koksta -700020 | india
T:+9 33 4037 3535 F:+91 33 4037 3505

Registered Office -

22504 .J.C Bose Road 4% Floor Kolkata — 700020 | India

W wiwerhilandcal .com, vy calcuftariverside com & wawy hilandgreens com

Dizclaimer: The information ¢ontained in thie electronlc meszage and any Fachments to thiz message are intended exclushely forthe addressee(s) and
contang propretary , confidential, prvileged information. Kyou ane not the inended negipient, you mua not disclese Fdisseminate. distbute orcopy the
information contained in this transmission. Such wauthonized use may be unlawful. ¥you have received thiz mes=sage in emor, please notify the sender
imrmedimely and destroy all copies of the message and any Aachments. Hiand Group iz not Kable for the improper transmiszion of this message nor for
any damage that may be sustained a5 a result of this message.
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Group accepts no Eabiley for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this e-mail,
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From: asitbasak20@yahoo.co.in [mailto:asitbasak20@yahoo.co.in]
Sent: Tuesday, January 05, 2021 9:45 PM

To: Team Hiland; Jayanta Ghosh

Subject: Registration of my apartment - Tower 35, Flat 13A3

Dear Sir,

In spite of repeated follow up, | could not get a call for Registration of my apartment. | have taken the handover way
back in April 2018 , paid all the registration, stamp and legal fees and continuing to pay monthly maintenance charge
within time.

However, sorry to say, the registration proceeding has

not been initiated at your end.



Please let me know the timing for Registration of my apartment at the earliest.

Regards,

Asit K Basak

Phone 9433390039



