21/02/2020 Gmail - Fwd: FW: query of Top flow Construction

?Wg aar BIBEK SETHIA <topflowconstruction@gmail.com>

Fwd: FW: query of Top flow Construction

2 messages

Ranjit Tiwari <ran58510@gmail.com> Wed, Jan 22, 2020 at 4:04 PM
To: BIBEK SETHIA <topflowconstruction@gmail.com>

Aurora waterfront legal queries
Kindly sclve the queries

---------- Forwarded message --=----=-

From: Debashish Halder <cpakolkatatwo@idbl co n>
Date: Wed, 22 Jan 2020, 3:42 pm

Subject: FW: query of Top flow Construction

To: <ran58510@gmail.com>

From: Mridul Ghosh [mailto:ghoshmridul7 @gmail.com]

Sent: 22 January 2020 15:02

To: Vishal Anand; samik.mazumdar@idbi.co.in; cpakolkatatwo@idbi.co.in; nilakshi.choudhury@idbi.co.in; Naveen
Subject: query of Top flow Construction

This mail originates from outside our organisation.

Please be extra vigilant before you click on a link, open attachments or reply .

Dated: January 22, 2020.
Place: Kolkata

Alc. no. 835/2107

To.

IDBI Bank Limited
6. Royed Street
Kolkata

Attn. Mr. Vishal Anand.
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21/02/2020 Gmail - Fwd: FW: query of Top flow Construction

Ref. NIL
Dear Sir
Sl. No. Name of the Applicants Received dated Query
1 Top flow Construction 20-01-2020 1 Agreement for Sale & Draft Deed of
Conveyance.
2 Development Agreement & Registered
GPA. if any.

3. NOC from U.D. Department.

4. Current tax receipt from present owner.

. N.B. Further queries may arise.
(Builder Purchase)

Thanking You,

Yours faithfully,

S.K Lath & Co.

Advocates
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Disclaimer: This e-mail contains privileged information or information belonging to IDBI Bank
Ltd and is intended solely for the addressee/s. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized. Any copying (whole or partial) or further distribution beyond the original
recipient is not intended, and may be unlawful. The recipient acknowledges that IDBI Bank Ltd
is unable to exercise control or ensure or guarantee the integrity of the contents of the
information contained in e-mail transmissions and further acknowledges that any views
expressed in this message are those of the individual sender and are not binding on IDBI Bank
Ltd. E-mails are susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. IDBI
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Gmail - Fwd: FW: query of Top flow Construction

Bank Ltd does not accept any liability for any damages caused on account of this e-mail. If
you have received this email in error, please contact the sender and delete the material from

your computer.

BIBEK SETHIA <topflowconstruction@gmail.com>

Wed, Jan 22, 2020 at 4:28 PM

To: omprakashsingh@somanirealtors.com, Amit Kumar Agarwal <gurorawaterfront@gmail.com>, ricky sethia

<rickysethia@gmail.com>, bibek sethia <bibek15148@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message --«------

From: Ranjit Tiwari <ran58510@gmail.com=

Date: Wed, Jan 22, 2020 at 4:04 PM

Subject: Fwd: FW: query of Top flow Construction

To: BIBEK SETHIA <topflowconstruction@gmail com>

Aurora waterfront legal queries
Kindly solve the queries

N Forwarded message --------
From: Debashish Halder <cpakolkatatwoi@iabi.con=
Date: Wed, 22 Jan 2020, 3:42 pm
Subject: FW: query of Top flow Construction
To: <ran58510@gmail.com>

From: Mridul Ghosh [mailto:ghoshmridul7 @gmail.com]
Sent: 22 January 2020 15:02

To: Vishal Anand; samik mazumdar@idbi.co.in; cpakolkatatwo@idbi.co.in; nilakshi.choudhury@idbi.co.in; Naveen

Subject: query of Top flow Construction

from outside ouz

before

This mail

Please be extra vig:

griginates organisation

lant you click on a link

open

attachments or reply

Dated: January 22, 2020
Place: Kolkata

Alc. no. 835/2107

To.

IDBI Bank Limited

6. Royed Street
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Gmail - Fwd: FW: query of Top flow Construction

Kolkata

West Bengal

Attn, Mr. Vishal Anand.

Ref. NIL

Dear Sir

Sl No. Name of the Applicants Received dated Query
1 Top flow Construction 20-01-2020 1. Agreement for Sale & Draft Deed of

Conveyance.
2 Development Agreement & Registered
GPA. if any.

(Builder Purchase)

3. NOC from U.D. Department.

4. Current tax receipt from present owner.

N.B. Further queries may arise.

Thanking You,

Yours faithfully,

S.K Lath & Co.

Advocates
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21/02/2020 Gmail - Fwd: FW: query of Top flow Construction

Disclaimer: This e-mail contains privileged information or information belonging to IDBI Bank
Ltd and is intended solely for the addressee/s. Access to this email by anyone else is
unauthorized. Any copying (whole or partial) or further distribution beyond the original
recipient is not intended, and may be unlawful. The recipient acknowledges that IDBI Bank Ltd
is unable to exercise control or ensure or guarantee the integrity of the contents of the
information contained in e-mail transmissions and further acknowledges that any views
expressed in this message are those of the individual sender and are not binding on IDBI Bank
Ltd. E-mails are susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. IDBI
Bank Ltd does not accept any liability for any damages caused on account of this e-mail. If
you have received this email in error, please contact the sender and delete the material from
your computer.
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