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Fwd: Request for Cancellation
Ram Pandey <rampandey23052001gmail.com> Tue, Mar 10, 2020 al 7:12 PM

To: "shambhu.kar09@gmail.com" <shambhu,kar09@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Neha Bagla <nbanla@biaracal conrs
Date: Tue. 25 Jun 2019 at 5:55 PM

Subject: Request for Cancellation

Tor <rigreine, oy V05, T EPare Ly s

Co: <indrorcninrale vl o>

Dear Mr. Pandey,

Greetings from Hiland Group!

This is with reference to request mail dated(l?.Ob.g‘.C;? egarding the canceliation of your apartment 8A4, Tower
31 at Hiland Greens. Sir, as discussed, giverrBefow is the calculation for the said canceltation. Once you confirm
the same, we will proceed with the said cancellation:

Mr. Ram Kumar Pandey - Tower 31, Apt. 8A4, Hiland Greens |

Total Property Cost . Total Recejved 15% of Apt. Cost + CP
e L
1,780,000.00 . \_,1:9/9%294 308,250.00
275000
2,055,000.00

Calculation of Refundable Amount :

Payment made by the customer 1,999,294.00
Less : Service Tax already raised 72,984.00
Less: Cancellation Charges @15% 308,250.00
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.- Less: Advance CAM Charges 22,440.00
halll g

Total refund to be done to the customer 1,595,620.00

Total Deduction is Rs. 4,03,674/-

Kindly confirm so that we ¢an do the needful.

Thanks

Regards
Heha Khettry Bagla
Deputy Meanager - Sales

A b
OE-HL.,N

Sales & Marketing Office
1 Neww Bata Road, iolksta -700140, India
+91 33 490-5497 6970  +91 33 2490.5970
: +91 83350 53836 nbagla@hiandcal com
Registered Office
225C A J € Bose Road 40 Floor, Kolkata — 700020, inda

Vi vy hitand.in

Disclaimer: The information contained in this electronic message and amy agachments to this message are intended exclusnely forthe addressee(s) and
containg proprietary, confidential, privileged information. you are not the irtended recipient, you muat not disslose f disseminate, distrbute or copy the
intormation contained in this transmission. Such unauthonzed use may be unlawful i you have received this message in emror, please notify the sender
immadigtely and dastroy all copies of the message and any Atachments. Hiland Group is not liable for the improper transmission of this message nor for
any damage that may be sustzined as aresult of this message

Waming Computer miruses may be transmited via e-mail The recipient should check this ¢-mail and any attachment forthe presence of vinyses Hiland
Group accepts he liability for any damage caused by amy virus transmittad by this e-mail.
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me

" to Neha
14 Jui 2019 View details

On Tue, 25 Jun 20°9 a1 5:55 PM, Neha Bagla < . ;- > wrote.

Aap se tequest bai, |, | ke aap xam s2 kam amou: deduc: kate Mujbe 1s a2l paiso
ki vahut jarurat har Apse request hai ke aap Jald se jald mujhe refund de saxe Kafi
problem me hu Kuch kam karke deduct kar | jiye. Aap kan tak amourt de sakie nai
Agar jaldi mil jata 10 apka pada upkar hoga ... Paiso ki saght jrura; hai ji.

Thanku

---- Ram pandey

Py sr

S Pnees,

Oirceligs

froem Hhibasd Grosn!



Neha Bagla

to me Indranii
15 Jul 2019 View details

Dcar Mr. Pandev.

The deduction amount cannot be changed &

the refund will take time. Kindly conlirm so
that [ can process vour cancellation,

[hanks

Fongn 10
Heha Khaettry Hagis
Deputy Menager Sales

Sales & Makaur] Offer
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me

to Neha
15 Jul 2019 View details

On Mon, 15 Jul 2019 at 1:37 PM, Neha Bagla <= - . e s wrote:

Agar ho sake to kuch kam kar dete aap se req.est thi

Agar nahi 10 ye amoart kab tak aap refund kar cenge  mu;ne paisc ki bru! b
wurat bar Jaisa k. maine pahle v braya Fai ke meri badi man <e 1 aaz e kaafi paisa
chala gya aur xarz me duo gye hai.

Aapse request har ke retund aap jitni aldi «ar saxe  1c apka bada upkaar hoga
l.adki ke Btech ke adm ssion ke live v paise pure hi hai

Tk nai yahi amount aap bas jald se jald refund xar e Mai conrirm karta hu

—

P s. Kisi ki mazboor  aur jarurat ko samjhe , .

Aap kab 1ak retund Iouta sakenge ak date bata de.
P's. Kam se kam samay lijiyega,

Deas N oelbos



